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THE MBINGA COFFEE EXCHANGE

Auction On Thursday, 23rd November, 2023

at 10.30 a.m.

AT THE EXCHANGE HALL
SALE NO. TCB/M/5

8,840 Bags of Tanzania Coffee Lying at Various Warehouses

TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SALE

Sale are subject to Tanzania Coffee Board Rules and Regulations 2013

Unless otherwise stated coffee is packed in single sisal bags of 60 Kgs. Net.
Tare weight 1.1 Kg. Bids shall be per 50 Kgs.

Confirmation of bids not later than 4.00 p.m.
Proceeds payable to TANZANIA COFFEE BOARD on or before Prompt date.

Nett weight as per WAREHOUSE warrant weights.
PROMPT DATE: 28th November, 2023




AUCTION SALE NO.TCB/M/5 TO BE HELD ON THURSDAY, 23 NOVEMBER 2023

TANZANIA COFFEE BOARD

MBINGA COFFEE -8,408 BAGS
L/NO DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS | PKTS N/KGS W/H WRN | B.NO | CERT | PRICE STATUS BUYER
LIALE FARM ESTATE
CO.LTD/NMB/026/042/190/304 Fol19 ] 51 M 189 | 304
1 1,191 40.00 | Sold COTACOF
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/039/280 F 1 35 CMS 133 280
2 95 40.00 | Sold IBERO
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/038/272 F 12 7 CMS 130 272
3 727 40.00 | Sold IBERO
;Cé;iﬁ?&% :‘MCOS/ NMB- F 98 49 MCCCO 1257 826
4 5,929 40.00 | Sold DORMAN
PKEE?]SAA‘Q’/A‘SA;\FOS/ CRDB- F 33 292 MCCCO 1307 871
5 2,002 76.00 | Sold IBERO
;ﬁé?%?%%MCOS/NMB' F 8 54 MCCCO 1228 810
6 534 46.00 | Sold COTACOF
P'\Eéi;l%l;‘/(;g) 4AMCOS/ CRDB- F 7 3 MCCCO 1265 834
7 423 45.00 | Sold TWT
KIBANDAI AMCOS/NMB- = 9 51 MCCCO 1973 | 840
PLC/132/842
8 591 48.00 | Sold COTACOF
ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/122/818 F 13 17 MCCCO 1236 | 818
9 797 45.00 | Sold DORMAN
KIHEREKETI
F 78 12 DAE 893 538
AM RDB
10 COS/CRDB/65/35/538 4,692 60.00 | Sold TWT
KIUKWA AMCOS/CPU/NMB- = 18 | 27 MCCCO 1282 | 849
PLC/130/849
11 1,107 90.00 | Sold IBERO
LANGANDONDO
F 3 3 MCCCO 1318 | 882
AMCOS/CPU/CRDB-PLC/137/882
12 / / 1371 183 51.00 | Sold TWT
ILELA
F 10 13 DAE 868 528
AMCOS/CPU/NMB/59/14/528
13 / / 139114/ 613 54.00 | Sold IBERO
LIALE FARM ESTATE
1T 10 44 CMS 138 303
CO.LTD/NMB/026/042/189/303
14 / /026/042/187/ 644 55.00 | Sold COTACOF
MHEKELA AMCQOS/CRDB/038/271 1T 2 38 CMS 129 271
15 158 60.00 | Sold COTACOF
KIHEREKETI
1T 24 12 DAE 892 537
AM RDB 7
16 COS/CRDB/65/35/53 1,452 60.00 | Sold DORMAN
Ff\[\é;g'\ﬁg ?MCOS/ NMB- 1T 8 53 MCCCO 1256 825
17 533 60.00 | Sold TWT
KILOSA AMCQOS/CRDB- T : 59 MCCCO 1306 | 870
PLC/142/870
18 82 60.00 | Sold COTACOF
NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB- T : 59 MECCO 1264 | 833
PLC/131/833
19 112 60.00 | Sold COTACOF
KIEANDA AMCOS/NMS- Tl |8 mccco | 122 | s
20 93 60.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/122/817 T 3 58 MCCCO 1235 | 817
21 238 60.00 | Sold IBERO
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L/NO DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS | PKTS N/KGS W/H WRN | B.NO | CERT | PRICE STATUS BUYER
ILELA
1T 9 37 DAE 867 527
AMCOS/CPU/NMB/59/14/527
22 / / 159114/ 577 102.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
AF 5 4 DAE 891 536
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/536
23 / 165135/ 304 75.00 | Sold IBERO
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/038/270 AF 5 51 CMS 128 270
24 351 77.00 | Sold TWT
LIALE FARM ESTATE
AF 6 20 CMS 137 301
CO.LTD/NMB/026/042/187/301
25 / /026/042/187/ 380 72.00 | Sold COTACOF
;\[‘é;i'f/)s% A’fA‘MCOS/ NMB- AF 21 38 MCCCO 1255 824
26 1,298 72.00 | Sold DORMAN
FED(CC/)]N;?% &MCOS/ NMB- AF 7 46 MCCCO 1227 809
27 466 70.00 | Sold TWT
PKL'(L:C/)]Sﬁ‘Q’/ASAQQCOS/ CRDE- AF 16 38 MCCCO 1305 | 869
28 998 78.00 | Sold IBERO
NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB- AF 5 : MECCO 1263 | 830
PLC/131/832
29 121 70.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
PK!(B:?;\I:BDQ%:E)MCOS/NMB_ AF 5 54 MCCCO 1271 840
30 354 91.00 | Sold COTACOF
ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/122/816 AF 10 6 MCCCO 1234 | 816
31 606 81.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
MHEKELA AMCQOS/CRDB/039/278 AF 2 0 CMS 132 278
32 120 84.00 | Sold COTACOF
PK&J:I;\]/\:/B/S\/QAI;QCOS/CPU/NMB— AF 2 58 MCCCO 1281 848
33 178 90.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
LANGANDONDO
AF 2 13 MCCCO 1317 881
AMCOS/CPU/CRDB-PLC/137/881
34 / / 137/ 133 90.00 | Sold COTACOF
ILELA
AF 2 0 DAE 866 526
AMCOS/CPU/NMB/59/14/526
35 / / 139114/ 120 99.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
E 2 21 DAE 890 535
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/535
36 /CRDB/6S/35/ 141 No bid
ILELA
E 1 27 DAE 865 525
AMCOS/CPU/NMB/59/14/525
37 / / 199114/ 87 58.00 | Sold IBERO
;Cé;EQ'\EgOQ ?MCOS/ NMB- C 108 | 15 MCCCO 1253 823
38 6,495 110.00 | Sold TWT
F’AE\é;EQI\AIt[/)% ?MCOS/ NMB- C 100 0 MCCCO 1254 823
39 6,000 110.00 | Sold TWT
PL&S]N;?% &MCOS/ NMB- C 292 43 MCCCO 1226 808
40 1,363 110.00 | Sold COTACOF
PK!(L:(?]S4A2’78A28COS/ CRDB- C 87 54 MCCCO 1304 868
41 5,274 132.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
PTéI;{%T/C;?] AMCOS/CRDB- C 21 25 MCCCO 1262 | 831
42 1,285 125.00 | Sold COTACOF
MHEKELA AMCQOS/CRDB/038/269 C 39 | 41 CMS 127 269
43 2,381 127.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
LIALE FARM ESTATE
C 61 3 CMS 136 302
CO.LTD/NMB/026/042/188/302
44 / /026/042/188/ 3,663 130.00 | Sold COTACOF
PK!E':?;\‘:’,DQ'/A;;;MCOS/NMB_ C ] 9 24 MCCCO 1270 839
45 1,164 132.00 | Sold TWT
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L/NO DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS | PKTS N/KGS W/H WRN | B.NO | CERT | PRICE STATUS BUYER
KIHEREKETI
C 65 4] DAE 889 534
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/534
46 / 165135/ 3,941 129.00 | Sold COTACOF
ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/122/815 C 37 | 26 MCCCO 1233 | 815
47 2,246 126.00 | Sold TWT
LANGANDONDO
C 29 | 42 MCCCO 1316 | 880
AMCOS/CPU/CRDB-PLC/137/880
48 / / N37/ 1,782 131.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
ILELA
C 17 21 DAE 864 524
AMCOS/CPU/NMB/59/14/524
49 / / 139114/ 1,041 131.00 | Sold COTACOF
MHEKELA AMCQOS/CRDB/039/277 C 10 0 CMS 131 277
50 600 123.00 | Sold TWT
PKnglj\]NSI(A)\ /22/;(305/ CPU/NMB- C 59 8 MCCCO 1280 847
51 3,548 134.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/041/292 B 2 32 CMS 146 | 292
52 152 No bid
PKLlé?]Sﬁ‘Q’/A‘;QS OS/CRDB- B 148 | 28 MCCCO 1303 | 867
53 8,908 140.00 | Sold DORMAN
Ii\[\é;)]E2'\zI5&% QAMCOS/ NMB- B 134 | 26 MCCCO 1250 822
54 8,066 140.00 | Sold DORMAN
;\[\é;EQI\L%; QAMCOS/ NMB- B 100 0 MCCCO 1251 822
55 6,000 140.00 | Sold COTACOF
;{‘é‘;EQI\L%DQéA‘MCOS/ NMB- B 100 0 MCCCO 1252 822
56 6,000 140.00 | Sold DORMAN
PL&S%??&B 6A\7MCOS/ NMB- B 47 51 MCCCO 1225 807
57 2,871 140.00 | Sold COTACOF
PT’é';%ng)OAMCOS/ CRDB- B 59 24 MCCCO 1261 830
58 3,564 140.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
PKLIEI:?;\I3E;/A\£|33A8MCOS/NMB— B 44 ] 6 MCCCO 1269 838
59 2,656 140.00 | Sold TWT
ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/122/814 B 57 | 52 MCCCO 1232 | 814
60 3,472 140.00 | Sold DORMAN
KIHEREKETI
B 100 0 DAE 883 533
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/533
61 / 165135/ 6,000 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
B 100 0 DAE 884 533
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/533
62 / 165135/ 6,000 150.00 | Sold DORMAN
KIHEREKETI
B 100 0 DAE 885 533
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/533
63 / 165735/ 6,000 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
B 100 0 DAE 886 533
AM RDB
64 COS/CRDB/65/35/533 6,000 146.00 | Sold IBERO
KIHEREKETI
B 100 0 DAE 887 533
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/533
65 / 165135/ 6,000 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
B 61 49 DAE 888 533
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/533
66 / 165135/ 3,709 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/040/284 B 2 19 CMS 141 284
67 139 140.00 | Sold TWT
ILELA
B 100 0O DAE 862 | 523
AM PU/NMB 14/52
68 COS/CRU/ 139/14/523 6,000 146.00 | Sold DORMAN
ILELA
B 79 39 DAE 863 523
AMCOS/CPU/NMB/59/14/523
69 / / 139114/ 4,779 143.00 | Sold COTACOF
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L/NO DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS | PKTS N/KGS W/H WRN | B.NO | CERT | PRICE STATUS BUYER
LANGANDONDO
AMCOS/CPU/CRDB-PLC/137/879
70 B 68 4 4,084 MCCCO | 1315 | 879 146.00 | Sold COTACOF
KIUKWA AMCOS/CPU/NMB- 192 | 26 MECCO 1079 | sas
PLC/130/846
71 B 7,346 150.00 | Sold DORMAN
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/041/291 A ] 21 CMS 145 291
72 81 No bid
KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB- A 142 | 23 MECCO 1201 | ses
PLC/142/866
73 8,543 142.00 | Sold DORMAN
KILOSA AMCQOS/CRDB- A 100 | 0 MECCO 302 | ses
PLC/142/866
74 6,000 142.00 | Sold COTACOF
FTC(Z%NQ\?% &MCOS/ NMB- A 77 34 MCCCO 1224 806
75 4,654 No bid
NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB- A 66 | 42 MECCO 1260 | 829
PLC/131/829
76 4,002 142.00 | Sold CETCO
;{‘é‘;z'\f/)&% ]AMCOS/ NMB- A 141 | 4] MCCCO 1245 821
77 8,501 142.00 | Sold COTACOF
P,\[\é;EQIjSE?Q ]AMCOS/ NMB- A 100 0 MCCCO 1246 821
78 6,000 Withdrawn
P,\[\é;EQIjSE?Q ]AMCOS/ NMB- A 100 0 MCCCO 1247 821
79 6,000 No bid
;{‘é‘;z'\f/)&% ]AMCOS/ NMB- A 100 0 MCCCO 1248 821
80 6,000 142.00 | Sold COTACOF
PACé;EQ'i%)Q ]AMCOS/ NMB- A 100 0 MCCCO 1249 821
81 6,000 No bid
PKEE??‘SDQ%;;MCOS/NMB_ A 84 3 MCCCO 1268 837
82 5,043 142.00 | Sold DORMAN
ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/122/813 A 120 | 27 MCCCO 1231 | 813
83 7,227 144.00 | Sold CETCO
KIHEREKETI
A 121 23 DAE 882 532
AM RDB 2
84 COS/CRDB/65/35/53 7,283 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
A 100 0 DAE 881 532
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/532
85 / /65/35/ 6,000 150.00 | Sold DORMAN
KIHEREKETI
A 100 0 DAE 880 532
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/532
86 / /65/35/ 6,000 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
A 100 0 DAE 879 532
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/532
87 / 165735/ 6,000 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
A 100 0 DAE 878 532
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/532
88 / /65/35/ 6,000 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
A 100 0 DAE 877 532
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/532
89 / 165135/ 6,000 150.00 | Sold DORMAN
ILELA
A 100 0 DAE 859 522
AMCOS/CPU/NMB/59/14/522
90 / / /591141 6,000 144.00 | Sold COTACOF
ILELA
A 100 0 DAE 860 522
AM PU/NMB/59/14/522
91 COS/CPU/ 15911475 6,000 144.00 | Sold DORMAN
ILELA
A 100 2 DAE 861 522
AMCOS/CPU/NMB/59/14/522
92 / / 139114/ 6,002 144.00 | Sold TWT
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/040/283 A 1 50 CMS 140 283
93 110 144.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
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L/NO DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS | PKTS N/KGS W/H WRN | B.NO | CERT | PRICE STATUS BUYER
LANGANDONDO
AMCOS/CPU/CRDB-PLC/137/878 | A | 125 15 MCCCO | 1314 ) 878
94 7,515 149.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIUKWA AMCOS/CPU/NME- A |100] 0 vecco | 178 | s
95 6,000 148.00 | Sold TWT
KUCWA AMCOS/CPU/NNE- A | 81 |5 vecco | 1277 | s
96 4,911 150.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/041/290 | AA 1 0 CMS 135 290
97 60 No bid
PK!(L:C/)]S;A‘Q’/A‘;Q?OS/ CRDB- AA 100 0 MCCCO 1299 865
98 6,000 142.00 | Sold COTACOF
PKL'EC/)]S;A‘Q’/ASAQSCOS/ CRDB- AA 100 0 MCCCO 1300 865
99 6,000 142.00 | Sold DORMAN
PKL'(L:C/)]S?;SAQ?OS/ CRDB- AA 93 56 MCCCO 1298 | 865
100 5,636 145.00 | Sold IBERO
PL&S%??&B &MCOS/ NMB- AA 106 | 41 MCCCO 1223 805
101 6,401 142.00 | Sold COTACOF
PT?:?%T/%SSAMCOS/ CRDB- AA 84 47 MCCCO 1259 828
102 5,087 142.00 | Sold IBERO
;\[\é;gi?; S\MCOS/ NMB- AA 149 | 20 MCCCO 1239 820
103 8,960 140.00 | Sold DORMAN
;{‘é‘;z'\f/)&% (’)A‘MCOS/ NMB- AA 100 0 MCCCO 1240 820
104 6,000 140.00 | Sold DORMAN
P'\[\é/P]EQI\L[/)Eg (’JAMCOS/ NMB- AA 100 0 MCCCO 1241 820
105 6,000 No bid
MAPENDO AMCOS/NNES AA [ 100 0 vecco | 1242 | &0
106 6,000 140.00 | Sold DORMAN
;{‘é‘;i'i%; S‘MCOS/ NMB- AA 100 0 MCCCO 1243 820
107 6,000 140.00 | Sold DORMAN
P'\[\é/P]EQI\ﬁg (’)AMCOS/ NMB- AA 100 0 MCCCO 1244 820
108 6,000 No bid
PKngj\;\gDz//Aél&MCOS/NMB— AA ] O] 33 MCCCO 1267 836
109 6,093 143.00 | Sold IBERO
ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/122/812 AA 131 14 MCCCO 1230 | 812
110 7,874 142.00 | Sold COTACOF
KIHEREKETI
AA 147 | 41 DAE 876 531
AM RDB 1
111 COS/CRDB/65/35/53 8,861 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
AA 100 0 DAE 873 531
112 AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/531 6,000 148.00 | Sold DORMAN
KIHEREKETI
AA 100 0 DAE 874 531
AM RDB 1
113 cos/c 165/35/53 6,000 148.00 | Sold IBERO
KIHEREKETI
AA 100 0 DAE 875 531
AM RDB 1
114 COS/CRDB/65/35/53 6,000 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/040/282 AA 2 0 CMS 135 282
115 120 144.00 | Sold TWT
ILELA
AA 144 | 40 DAE 858 521
AM PU/NMB 14/521
116 COS/CPU/ 13911415 8,680 146.00 | Sold CETCO
ILELA
AA 100 0 DAE 857 521
AM PU/NMB 14/521
117 COS/CPU/ 13911415 6,000 148.00 | Sold COTACOF
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LANGANDONDO
AA 104 | 49 MCCCO 1313 | 877
AM PU/CRDB-PLC/137
118 COS/CPU/C Cr137/877 6,289 150.00 | Sold COTACOF
] PKLl(Lélj\]/é,S/ngOS/CPU/ NMB- AA 100 0 MCCCO 1276 844
119 6,000 150.00 | Sold DORMAN
] |Aeepaos/erumme AA | 93 | 32 vecco | 1275 | sas
120 5,612 150.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
AAA | 100 0 DAE 871 530
AM RDB
121 } COS/CRDB/65/35/530 6,000 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
AAA 63 19 DAE 872 530
AMCOS/CRDB/65/35/530
122 } / 165135/ 3,799 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
ILELA
AAA | 74 35 DAE 856 520
193 AMCOS/CPU/NMB/59/14/520 4.475 152.00 | Sold DORMAN
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/041/289 PB 1 0 CMS 143 289
124 60 No bid
PK!(L:C/)]S;A‘Q’/A‘SAQEOS/ CRDE- PB 95 18 MCCCO 1297 | 864
125 5,718 144.00 | Sold COTACOF
PL&S%??&B &MCOS/ NMB- PB 44 25 MCCCO 1222 | 804
126 2,665 140.00 | Sold COTACOF
PT?:?%T/%E;AMCOS/CRDB_ PB 25 ] ] MCCCO 1258 827
127 1,511 140.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
] P'\[\é‘;E;%)]?MCOS/NMB' PB 133 | 13 MCCCO 1237 819
128 7,993 No bid
] P'\[\é/P]EQI\L[/)g?MCOS/NMB' PB 100 0 MCCCO 1238 819
129 6,000 No bid
KBANDAI AMCOS/NME P | 32 | 2 vecco | 126 | s
130 1,922 140.00 | Sold IBERO
ILELA
PB 37 ] MCCCO 1229 811
AM PU/NMB/122/14/811
131 COS/CPU/ /122/14/8 2,221 145.00 | Sold DORMAN
KIHEREKETI
PB 100 0 DAE 869 529
AM RDB 29
132 ] COS/CRDB/65/35/5 6,000 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
KIHEREKETI
PB 96 18 DAE 870 529
AM RDB 29
133 ] COS/CRDB/65/35/5 5,778 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/040/281 PB 1 40 CMS 134 | 28I
134 100 130.00 | Sold DORMAN
ILELA
PB 80 16 DAE 855 519
AM PU/NMB 14/51
135 COS/CPU/ /39/14/519 4,816 148.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
LANGANDONDO
PB 25 54 MCCCO 1312 | 876
AM PU/CRDB-PLC/137/87
136 COS/CPU/C CI137/876 1,554 145.00 | Sold DORMAN
PKEESYES/';\%COS/CPU/NMB_ PB 98 2] MCCCO 1274 843
137 5,901 150.00 | Sold K. PAMOJA
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/041/296 uG 2 49 CMS 147 296
138 169 Withdrawn
MHEKELA AMCOS/CRDB/040/288 UG 2 53 CMS 142 288
139 173 70.00 | Sold TWT
F}tlcl:l\l/(])@%\gsOS/CRDB- F 1 52 MCCCO | 1341 | 905
140 112 41.00 | Sold COTACOF
WINO AMCQOS/CRDB- AF 0 57 MECCO 1340 | 904
PLC/148/904
141 57 40.00 | Sold COTACOF
F}t/(':'\'/? 4’2%5305/ CRDB- C 8 51 MCCCO 1339 903
142 531 119.00 | Sold TWT
F}tllcl\l/(]) 4’2;;\5205/ CRDB- B 21 18 MCCCO 1338 902
143 1,278 141.00 | Sold IBERO
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L/NO DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS | PKTS N/KGS W/H WRN | B.NO | CERT | PRICE STATUS BUYER
;’L/(l:'\}]o 4’2%\8:105/ CRDB- A 43 52 MCCCO 1337 | 901

144 2,632 147.00 | Sold TWT
P\t/(lil\l/? 4’2‘%\0(:005/ CRDB- AA 62 44 MCCCO 1336 | 900

145 3,764 148.00 | Sold TWT
F}t/ 'C'\}? 4’2%\5905/ CRDB- PB 15 56 MCCCO 1335 899

146 956 142.00 | Sold IBERO
KALONGE FARM LTD/NMB- MCCCO-
PLC/098/10107/668 F 1017 MBZ 717 | 68

147 607 45.00 | Sold DORMAN
KALONGE FARM LTD/NMB- C 5 38 MCCCO- o1 470
PLC/098/10107/670 MBZ

148 338 120.00 | Sold COTACOF
KALONcE A Lo s | 27 |

149 1,669 142.00 | Sold IBERO
KALONGE FARM LTD/NMB- A 1 20 MCCCO- 273 | 470
PLC/098/10107/672 MBZ

150 680 144.00 | Sold DORMAN
KALONGE FARM LTD/NMB- MCCCO-
PLC/098/10107/673 AA LS ]S MBZ 724 ) 68

151 351 147.00 | Sold IBERO
SAONCEE e | 5 | s

152 218 73.00 | Sold IBERO
NANGONDO AMCOS LTD/CRDB
BANK/MBZ/037/2023/280(WD M 4 F 1 51 CMS-MBZ | 216 | 280

153 LOT NO 265)SNG 111 No bid
ITEPULA AMCOS
LTD/MBZ/049/2023/346(WD M 5 F 4 14 CMS-MBZ | 413 | 346

154 LOT 140)SNG 254 No bid
TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMé33COS LTD &
NMB PLC 096/10116/633(WD M 5 F 52 13 MCCCO- | 683 | 633

155 LOT 141)SNG 3,133 MBZ 40.00 | Sold COTACOF
TUTAFIKA IKUTI AM633COS LTD &
NMB PLC067/10104/440(WD M 5 T 19 0 MCCCO- | 488 | 440

156 LOT 268)SNG 1,140 MBZ No bid
BAHANKO AMCOS LTD/NMB
BANK/MBZ/043/2023/311(WD M 5 T 14 0 CMS-MBZ | 292 | 311

157 LOT 269)SNG 840 No bid
NANGONDO AMCOS LTD/CRDB
BANK/MBZ/037/2023/278(WD M 5 AF 1 38 CMS-MBZ | 214 | 278

158 LOT 271)SNG 98 No bid
NANSAMA AMCOS LTD/CRDB
BANK/MBZ/033/2023/243(WD M 5 AF 0 26 CMS-MBZ | 213 | 243

159 LOT NO 272)SNG 26 No bid
TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS LTD & NBC
096/10116/635(WD M 5 LOT AF 7 51 MCCCO- | 685 | 51

160 167)SNG 471 MBZ No bid
NGUILUKA AMCOS
LTD/RNG/057/2023/408 (WD M 5 AF 2 25 CMS-MBZ | 419 | 408

161 LOT 171)SNG 145 No bid
NANGONDO AMCOS LTD/CRDB
BANK/MBZ/037/2023/277 (WD M 5 C 6 35 CMS-MBZ | 213 | 277

162 LOT 276)SNG 395 90.00 | Sold TWT
NANGONDO AMCOS LTD/CRDB
BANK/MBZ/037/2023/276(WD M 5 B 27 40 CMS-MBZ | 212 | 276

163 LOT 280)SNG 1,660 No bid
TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS LTD & NMB
PLC 067/10104/443(WD M 5 LOT B 127 | 42 MCCCO- | 491 | 443

164 284)SNG 7,662 MBZ No bid
TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS LTD & NMB
PLC 096/10116/637(WD M 5 LOT B 52 31 MCCCO- | 688 | 637

165 198)SNG 3,151 MBZ 138.00 | Sold COTACOF
NGUILUKA AMCOS
LTD/RNG/057/2023/4069(WD M 5 B 81 0 CMS-MBZ | 417 | 406

166 LOT NO 199)SNG 4,860 138.00 | Sold COTACOF
IBABA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC
067/10118/646(WD M 5 LOT NO B 8 18 MCCCO- | 697 | 646

167 201)SNG 498 MBZ No bid
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L/NO DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS | PKTS N/KGS W/H WRN | B.NO | CERT | PRICE STATUS BUYER
NANGONDO AMCOS LTD/CRDB
BANK/MBZ/037/2023/275(WD M 5 A 11 3 MCCCO- | 211 | 276

168 LOT NO.285)SNG 663 MBZ No bid
TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS LTD & NMB
PLC 067/10104/444(WD M 5LOT A 91 51 MCCCO- | 492 | 444

169 NO.287)SNG 5,511 MBZ No bid
IBABA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC
067/10118/647(WD M 5 LOT A 6 50 MCCCO- | 698 | 647

170 NO.213)SNG 410 MBZ No bid
NGUILUKA AMCOS
LTD/RNG/057/2023/405(WD M 5 A 65 9 CMS-MBZ | 416 | 405

171 LOT NO.224)SNG 3,909 140.00 | Sold TWT
TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS LDT & NBC
PLC 096/10116/638(WD M 5 LOT A 88 48 MCCCO- | 689 | 638

172 NO.222)SNG 5,328 MBZ No bid

NANGONDO AMCOS LTD/CRDB

BANK/MBZ/037/2023/274 WD M5

173 LOT292 SNG AA 7 19 439 CMS-MBZ | 689 | 638 No bid
LUNJI ESTATE
LTD/MBY/CRDB/120/818(WD M 5 AA 6 52 CCL-MBY | 623 | 818

174 LOT NO.228)SNG 412 No bid
IBABA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC
087/10118/648(WD M 5 LOT AA 2 49 MCCCO- | 699 | 648

175 NO.229)SNG 169 MBZ No bid
NGUILUKA AMCOS
LTD/RNG/057/2023/403(WD M 5 72 14

176 LOT NO.240)SNG AA 4,334 | CMS-MBZ | 210 | 274 140.00 | Sold COTACOF
NANGONDO AMCOS LTD/CRDB
BANK/MBZ/037/2023/0273(WD M PB 3 17 CMS-MBZ | 209 | 273

177 5LOT NO.296)SNG 197 No bid
TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS LTD & NBC
PLC 096/10116/640(WD M 5 LOT PB 27 30 MCCCO- | 691 | 640

178 NO.251)SNG 1,650 MBZ Withdrawn
NGUILUKA AMCOS
LTD/RNG/057/2023/403(WD M 5 PB 40 6 CMS-MBZ | 414 | 403

179 LOT NO.254)SNG 2,406 137.00 | Sold COTACOF
LUSONGWE AMCOS LTD*CPU*&
CRDB PLC 084/10024/621(WD M 5 uG 7 7 MCCCO- | 671 | 621

180 LOT.NO.262)SNG 427 MBZ No bid
NAMSWEA AMCOS/NBC-
PLC/100/772. WD M5 MBG LOT F 2 57 MCCCO 772

181 NO 1 177 No bid
MKALANGA
AMCOS/NMB/55/09/430. WD M5 F 6 21 DAE 430

182 MBG LOT NO 6 381 No bid
LUWIHI
AMCOS/CRDB/48/06/410.WD M5 F 7 19 DAE 410

183 MBG LOTNO 8 439 40.00 | Sold COTACOF
UMOJA
AMCOS/CRDB/64/03/474.WD M5 1T 53 4 DAE 474

184 MBG LOTNO 13 3,184 Withdrawn
LAINI AMCOS/CRDB-
PLC/079/52.WD M5 MBG LOT NO TT 2 10 MCCCO 521

185 17 130 60.00 | Sold COTACOF
UMOJA
AMCOS/CRDB/64/03/473.WD M5 AF 6 1 DAE 473

186 MBG LOT NO 20. 361 62.00 | Sold COTACOF
MKALANGA
AMCOS/NMB/55/09/427. WD M5 E 1 0 DAE 427

187 MBG LOT NO 31 60 No bid
MAGUU
AMCOS/NMB/47/25/398.WD M5 E 2 14 DAE 398

188 MBG LOT NO 32 134 50.00 | Sold COTACOF
MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-
PLC/012/188.WD M5 MBG LOT NO A 100 | O MCCCO 188

189 84 6,000 Withdrawn
MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-
PLC/012/189.WD M5 MBG LOT NO A 100 | O MCCCO 188

190 85 6,000 Withdrawn
MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-
PLC/012/188.WD M5 MBG LOT NO A 53 | 14 MCCCO 188

191 86 3,194 Withdrawn
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L/NO

DESCRIPTION

GRADE

BAGS

PKTS

N/KGS

W/H

WRN

B.NO

CERT

PRICE

STATUS

BUYER

192

MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-
PLC/012/187.WD M5 MBG LOT NO
115

AA

99

51

5,991

MCCCO

187

Withdrawn

193

LUWIHI
AMCOS/CRDB/48/06/410.WD M5
MBG LOT NO 124

PB

50

50

3,050

DAE

402

Withdrawn
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